
Rappaport, Ryan

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Woli Kevin

Tuesday, June 14, 202? 8.55 Al\A

Rappaport, Ryan

Add On Sewers

Ryan,

Can you follow-up on both of these sewer connections? I believe the one for 7065 Montgomery Road was a BRF. Come

see me first before you go out to inspect this one as it involves the property owner at 7055 Montgomery Road.

Kevin

From: Smith, Darrell <.iasmith@howardcountymd.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, lune 74,2022 7:56 AM
To: lsaacs, Joel <jisaacs@howa rdcountymd.gov>; Routhier, Cameron N. <crouthier@ howa rdcountymd.gov>; Williams,
Jeffrey <jewilliams@ howa rdcountymd.gov>; Wolf, Kevin <KWolf@ howa rdcountymd.gov>
Subject: Add On Sewers

8350 Grove A P220007 35 1tot.- onlle- 3J."# h;
We are com plete

Da rrell Smith
Plumbing/Mechanical Supervisor
Md. State Master Plum bing/Mechanical lnspector
ICC Commercial/Residential Plumbing lnspector
7125 Riverwood Dr. 5t. D2

Columbia, Md. 21046
Phone: 410-313-1841

Fax: 410-313-1861

" lsn't it nice to think that tomorrow is a new day with no mistakes in it yet?"
" L.M. Montgomery''

I
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Fogle's Septic Clean Inc.
Fogle's Portable Toilets. [oglc's Well Drilliug LLC. Fogle's Excavaling, LLC

lt:lae 14,2022

Howald Co Dept of Environmental Health
8930 Stanford Blvd
Columbia, Md 21045

To Whom it may concern,

On June 10, 2022 Fogle's Septic Clean Inc, has abandoned the septic tank located at 8350

Grove Anglc Rd in Ellicott City fol Chiguang Feng. They are now hooked up to public
sewer.
lfyou have any questions please call me at the office 410-795-5670,

Sincerely,
^ t r/l
'M,"/ !^M//

"Kurt Cassell I

Fogle's Septic Clean, [nc.

![ 1'

SEPTIC & PORTABLES
FC,GLE'S

580 Obrecht Road . Syke6vi 6. ldsryla 21784
Phon€ (410) 7€5-5670 FAX (410) 795-3432



HOWARD COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS

3430 COURT HOUSE DRIVE. ELLICOTT CITY, MD 21043
* THIS PERMIT MUST BE COA'SP'CUOUSLY POSTED O'V S'IE *

Residential Plumbing Addition Alteration Permit

PERMIT NUMBER: P?20Q07 35 APPLICATION D AI E: 212212022 ISSUE DATE: 212212022

SITE ADDRESS:
8350 GROVE ANGLE RD
ELLICOTT CITY, MD 21043

Subdivision:

Lot No.: Tax Map: 31

ADC Map:4936-83 SDP No.:

DESCRIPTION OF WORK:
SFD:// CONNECT TO COUNTY SEWER

PROPERTY OWNER INFO:
FENG CHIGUANG
3605 HOLLAND HERBERT COURT
ELLICOTT CIry, MD 21042

Water Contract #:

Sewer Contract #: 302

Census Tract: 602302

PRIMARY CONTRAGTOR INFO:
Licensee: DALE H FOGLE
Plum/Gas License No.: UTL09047

Business Name: FOGLE'S SEPTIC CLEAN, INC

License Address: 580 OBRECHT ROAD

SYKESVILLE, MD 21784

PhoneNumber: 4107955670

Sanitary Pipe Size: 4

Sanitary Pipe Length: '140

Sanitary Pipe Materials: PVC

Water Pipe Size:

Water Pipe Length:

Water Pipe Materials:

Water & Sewer Type: SEWER

Storm Pipe Size:

Storm Pipe Length:

Storm Pipe Materials:

Gas Pipe Size:

Gas Pipe Length:

Gas Pipe Malerials:

BGE WO #:

Permit Fees:

Total Fe€s lnvoiced:

Total Fees Paid:

Balance Due;

To schedul€ an inspection or check the results ol an inspection please call (410) 313-3800

APPROVED BY THE DI CTOR OF INSPECTIONS. LICENSES AND PERMITS. BUILDING OFFICIAL

$215.00

$215.00

$0.00

Building Permit #: N/A

Existing Use: SFD

Total Fixtures:

Total Gas Fixtures:

Gas Meter: Neither

Gas System Type:

Total Gas BTU's:

Grid: 3'l -13

Zoning: R-20

Building / Plumbing Characteristics



Rental License Application
Howard @unty, Maryland

Depaftnent of Inspections, Ucensa, and
PemiE

3430 CoiJrt House Drive
Blicoft Crty, MD 21043
Licenses: 410-313-2455

Inspeclions: 410-313-1830
\./vrw.howardcouotvmd.oov

REGEI}IED
tEE z 4 l0t4

r-tcENSES & PERMIS
DIVtstofl

LICENSE
APPLICATIOI{
(MOne)

trt{ry
tr Ren6 al
tr Update Info
tr TratEfer O.vner

This lom nun be Cgnd by the propedy owner or legally authodzed indiidual (tutBr of Altomey Required).

lhe propeiy owet's infotmation may not cmbin dE same address as the rental Wpety addrcss, unless the owner is
renting wt rooq6, a le,el of a home or an apartnent h their $imary residence, Aarificahon is requited under'Ty@ of

me propety owne/s infonnation may not @otain a n &ox unl6 listed as a business eqfty, or an An/Fn/Drc tux.

fhe leal/r$ident agent is b1e pe6on/entity r$Nnsiue b a$ept legalpmces on the behalf of the properly owner.

Physrcal Property Address: Unit:rove ng

cityr ElllCOII Ult] state: MU Zip Coae:21O43

E Single Family Dwelling B Townhouse tr Duplex tr MobileHome tr Multi-Family Complex

guang ng amagucOwne/s Name (As it aryears on tax records)i suya o

Business Entity Of appliable). tr Corporatjon tr Association tr Partnership tr Trust tr O$er:

owner's Address/Principal omce:3605 HOlland Herbert L;t

city: Ellicott Uitl StaE: MD 1,^.^A-.21042
p6e6s. 41 U4UUU3 /U se;1;2405655411 Fax:

611611. leng2085 1 @yahoo.cOm
Additional Info:

engguangName:

Company:

rddress:3605 Holland I'ierbert Ct
cityr Ellicott City State: MD 71p s64a12'l.O42
p6q6s.41 0480E378 sg1;.240565541 I Fax:

oo.com

(If Applicabte)

ya

REQUIRED f owner is out-of-state or a busioes enbty

Email: eng

Name

Company Company

Address: Address:

City City:

State Zip Code State: zip

Phone: Phone

Cell Cell

Fax I

Emaal Email:

RENTAL PROPERTY INFORMATIONI REQUIRED _ PLEASE PRI TOR TYPE

TYPE OF STRUCTURE

BILLING CONTACT: REQUTRED - PLEASE PRINT OR |YPE

PROPERTY MANAGEMENT LOCAL OR RESIDENT AGENT:

1T:\Operations\UpdatedForms\RenblApplication03.05.20 13

u.""*# RH IAOODIgi

P/'"t'u

ru
When completing the application, pleas€ note:

Subdivislon/Village/Complex Name:

PROPERTY OWNER INFORMATION: REQUTRED. PLEASE PRINT OR |YPE

Name:

Fax:



E Srnqle Famrly Dwelling D Townhouse D
2

# of bedrooms an unit(s): _ Other

Individually Owned Condominium

lnfo:

tr Duplex tr Nlobile Home O Rooming Unit(s)

o Hotel tr Motel

# of units:

tr Bed and &eakfasl E Apartment Complex

Other Info:

REQUIRED:

Is the property part of a local Home Owner's Asrodaum or Condo Association? fPlcase drcle One) D Yes* I No

,ff yes, by slgnlng thls document, I cerllfy that my rssoclatlon fees are carrent and/or not more than iO days past due AND

thera ls no outstandlng flnal adJudlcatlon agrlost mqus for fallurc to pay sald fees to the governlng assoclatlon.

State: zip code:

Email:

Year Builtr*: # of storles (Above Ground): Pubhc Owned: O Yes I No Historicrl oistrict: O Yes n No

City:

Association Name:

Address:

'*Propertles bullt before 1950 must provlde a physlcrl copy of the ,taryland Department of the Envlroament (r'rOE) lead
certlflcatlon, whlch must be kept current.

After 02/24/2004 ALL atreded propefties in which a persoo at nsk (i.e. Under the age of 6, or a pregnant woman) and of whom the ownet has
been notified in witing mun 9W the isk reduction standard as specifred in 5 6-81 5(a) of b1e Environnent Atticle.

l4DE Lead Inspection Certificate # Sprinkler System: tr Yes E No

Type ofsmoke Detector: tr Battery Powered ts Hard Wired El Combo CO O Ljnknown

*noke detectos are requitd on eadt f,oor level at irgide eadt bdroom of all residenhel ocaJparr.jes.

Water Supply: E Public tr Private tr lJnknown Sewage Disposal: E Public O P.ivate tr tjnknown

A rental llcense application must b€ on file with th€ Department of Inspections, Li(€ns€s. and Permits, all necessary fees paid,
and an inspection conducted and approved, befor€ the lssuance of the R€ntal Housing License. Applications explrE 6 months after
t re date of appllcatlon if no inspecuon has been conducted and approv6d. Th€ Owne/s (ontad informauon must b. kept curisnt

application and know dre same is true and correct and that in renung this dwelling unit, all provisions of Howard County
Ordinances and Stat€ Laws will bo complied with whether hereir or rot,

Please make checks payable to: Dlrector of Flnance- Hotvard CouDtv, R.enewable every two years.

THIS OFFICE tIUST BE NOTIFIED OF Al{Y CHANGES; I.E. OWNER.S ADDRESS, AGENT BEING ADDED OR DELETED, PROPERTY
BECOHTNG OWNER OCCUPIED. SOU), OWNERSHIP TRANSFERjS, ETC.

FAILURE TO DO SO T4AY RESULT IT{ UTTE FEES AND CIVIL CITATIO'{S PER HOWARD Cq'NTY CODE 14. 901 (d)(T).

Utilites: trGas E Eleckic O Unknown

Date!, /JD /JDl+

Set IDlnvoice# I

to
t,

Feei

Eaintain the ticense.
uhrguang Feng

Check #: \Date Entered: ,- /

(Owner- please prlni have carcfully examined and read this

9l)

l,lanager/ Ag€nt Signatl,ra (If Appllcable)Property Owner Signature REQUIRED

AGREEMENT/ DISCLAIMER:

FOR OF.ICE USE ONLY

z

TYPE OF RENTAL UNIT: REQUTRED - PLEASE PRI T OR IYPE

I

i

tr &artment(s) tr Accessory Apartrnent (In Owne/s Primary Residence) ,qeqaliEs Approval fiom the Depa,tnent of Planning and Zoning

#ofUnits:-AddibonalclariFcauon(i.e'locationofUnit,etc.):-

Phone: _

E Group Home tr Assisted Living Sleeping areas ln basment nust meet mhimum egress requirements

# of sleeping rooms: _ To be licensed for_ # of clients Other Info: _

PLEASE CHECK/RESPOND TO ALL THAT APPLY:



RENTAL HOUSING LICENSE

LICENSE NUMBER: RH14000134 APPLICATION DAfEi 212512014 ISSUEDATE:'12t2412019

PROPERTY OWNER INFO:

CHIGUANG FENG & TSUYAKO YAMAGUCHI
3605 HOLLAND HERBERT COURT

ELLICOTT CIry, MD 21042

Subdivision:

Lot No.:

Tax Map: 3'l

Zoning: R-20

Grid: 31 -13

PROPERTY LOCATION:

8350 GROVE ANGLE RD
ELLICOTT CITY, MD 21043

Public Owned: No

Historic District: N

Historic District Registry No:

CHIGUANG FENG

3605 HOLLAND HERBERT COURT

ELLTCOTT Ctry, MO 21042

Year Built:

Name of Complex:

Type of Rental:

No. of Stories:

No. of Ljnits:

Single Family Detached

1

1

No. of Smoke Detectors:

Sprinkler System:

No of Sleeping Rooms:

Type of Smoke Detector:

Number of Bedrooms:

None

Hard Wired

2

Comments:

This License Will Expire On: Friday, February 25,2022

APPROVED BY THE DIRECTOR OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS - BUILDING OFFICIAL

HOWARD COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS

3430 COURT HOUSE DRIVE

ELLTCOTT C!TY, MD 21043

MANAGEMENT COMPANY INFO: BILLING CONTACT INFO:

Rental Property Details



SDAT: Real Property Search'

Real Propert-v Data Search ( !v.l)

Search Result for HOWARD COUNTY

Page I of I

Vierv Mao Vierv CroundRent Redemntion Vic$ (; rou nd Rent Reeistft
Account Idcntifier: District - 02 Account Number - 253178

Owncr lnformation

Owner Name:

Mailinq Address:

FENG CHIGUANG
YAMAGUCHI TSUYAKO
3605 HOLLAND HERBERT COURT
ELLICOTT CITY MD 21042.

Use:
Princioal Residence:

Deed Reference:

RESIDENTIAL
NO
r) n5297t 00053
2)

Locatiorl & Structure lnformation

8350 E GROVE ANGLE RD
ELLICOTT CITY 2IO43.OOOO

Lesal Descrintion:
.918 A
8350 GROVE A1

ELLICOTT CII
Map:
0031

Grid:
0013

Parcel: Sub District:
0046

Subdivision:
0000

Section: Block: Lot: Assessment Year:
2012

Soecial Tax Areas:
Town:
Ad Valorem:
Tax Class:

NONI
t04

Primarv Structur€ Buill
1956

AboYe Grade Enclosed Area
884 SF

Finished Basement Area Property Land Area
39 88 SF

Stories
1.000000

Basem€nt
YES

TvDe
STANDARD UNIT

Exterior
FRAME

Full/Half Bath
l full

Garage Last Maior Renr

Value I nformation

Land:
Improvements
Total:
Preferential Land:

Base Value

248,100
43,000
291,100
0

Value
As of
0y01i2012
191,400
43,000
234,400

Phase-in Assessments
As of
01t0u2013

234,400

As of
07t0y

234,4(
0

'Iransfer I nformation

Seller: WISEMAN ROBERT LEO L/T
Tvne: ARMS LENGTH IMPROVED

Dzte: l0l23l20l3
529?/ 00053

Price: $230,000
Deqd2: .

Seller: WISEMAN ROBERT LEO
Tvoe: NON-ARMS LENGTH OTHER

Dslg!_06/ r 6/2 006
Deedl: /10070/ 00618

Price: $0
Deed2:
Price:
Deed2l

Seller:
Tvpe:

Date:
I

Excmption ln formation

Partial Ex€mDt Assessm€nts:
Countv:
State:

Class
000
000
000

0710y20t3
0.00
0.00
0. 00

07t0y2014

0. 0.00

Tax Exempt:
ExcfnDt Classi

Special Tax Recapture:
NONE

Honrestead Application lnformation

http://sdat.resiusa.org/RealProperty/Pages/default.aspx

Premises Address:

Homestead Application Status: No Application

2t25t2014



TIEIL
PLUMBIIIE

8177 Nlission Rd.
lessup, Maryland 20794

(470) 799-7727
office@heilplumbing.com

DATE

04/a4/2022

BILL TO

Feng, Chiguang
3605 Holland Herbert Court

Ellicott City, MD 21042

PO/REF#

lnvoice
04t2512022

181680

Due Upon Receipt

SERVICE LOCATION

8350 Grove Angle Road
Ellicott City, IIO 21043

DESCRIPTION

SHC Right of Way (ROW) work Existing DHC

Attempted to locate the existing DHC (According to the County
Records the DHC is Iocated 17.3 from MH 4719)

4/4/22 - )oel Al and Jake
Sunrise Traffic control company setup a lane closure/diversion
Laid out the plates with lust Solutions for them to cut and mill
the road to recess the plates 17.3 CL from MH 4719
l"'lilled across the roadway 6'wide (144 sq. ft.). Cleaned this
area with mechanical blowers and brooms. Hauled all debris off
site.
once the milling was complete Heil Plumbing excavated and
once we got roughly 10 feet, put the trench box in the
excavation and started to poke around the ditch and didn't find
anything. Then we started to excavate deeper over top of the
main, once we got down to 13' 4" deep and poked around and
didn't flnd anything. Worked late to get the excavation back
filled and roadway passable.

4/5/22 - Joel and AJ
Met with Howard County to determine if a DHC or SHC actually
existed in the sewer main line, during inspection with a camera
Howard County found a DHC 13 Feet from the manhole, The
DHC appeared to have a ninety degree bend at the top of the
drop so it appeared that the DHC had been installed into the
property line under the driveway. Had Charlie come out to talk
with Roy to figure out what is the next step to proceed with
getting the customer provided wlth county sewer tap. It was
decided that the next step would be to excavate in the
driveway in an attempt to locate the DHC.

4/14/22 - loel and Ronnie
Removed an area oF asphalt then excavated across the drive
way long way in order to verify whether or not the sewer lateral
(DHC) was installed to the property line. The county wanted us
to verify that their was nothing ran across the street because
when they came out to camera the lane we were able to see the
stand pipe and a 90 bend which was roughly 4 ft different from
where described in the plans. Roy with Howard county wanted
a price to run a new drop connection from the man hole back
to the property. Backfill clean up site seed and straw.

4/21/22 - -ftaffic Control, Just Solutions
Repair asphalt in the roadway and extra asphalt repair in the
driveway.

4/22/22 -
Remove road plates and deliver to Heil Plumbing Yard

The owner shall post the bond with the County and pay all
municipal fees
After trench has been backfilled and compacted, tack all

JOB#

7 4241227

rrrt 13

DATE

lNvolcE#

TERMS



vertical edges of the asphalt trench and install two lifts of 3" of
19.5mm base asphalt. Compact same with vibratory roller to
industry standards.
Apply tack to the horizontal surfaces of the B' x 6' milled area
to industry standards.
Install 2" of 9.5 mm surface asphalt and compact same with a
vibratory roller to industry standards.
Allow the asphalt to cool prior to opening the roadway to
traffic.
Clean the job site with mechanical blowers and brooms.
Remove and haul any remaining debris

Work will be completed during our regular work hours of
7:00am-3r30pm.
This estimate includes up to 4 days of the Heil Plumbing
Underground and 1 day for the Just Solutions Asphalt Team.
For each additional day there will be a charge of $4,500.00.
This estimate includes 1 mobilizations (one for Heil Plumbing &
one for the asphalt contractor Just solutions). Each additional
mobilization will be a charge of $1,500.00.
This estimate includes 4 days of traffic control. Each additional
day will be a charge of $1,650.00.
Any change in the size and scope of the job to include, but not
limited to: additional excavation(s), soil conditions, county
requirements, the square footage to be milled, thickness of
asphalt or materials supplied
(described above) will be an additional charge.

30o/o deposit, 35olo upon start & 35o/o upon completion

Job Charges

Sewer House Connection
New SHC

Addltional Asphalt patch in the driveway
Asphalt repair/replacement includes new base

Job Subtotal

Job Total

PRE.WORK SIGNATURE

CUSTOIIER lrlESSAGE

We are dedicated to offering the highest quality
plumbing for every customer, We stand by the service
we provide, so if you are not satisfied please contact us
within a year of service. Heil Plumbing's warranty does
not cover drain cleaning, or,!ner furnished parts,
ordinary weat damage caused by improper use, or
exceptions that are noted. Callbacks are addressed
during normal business hours F4onday - Friday 7:30AM
- 4:30PM.

Completion Notes:

Qtv

1.00

1.00

Rate

$27,880.00

$ 1,2 00.00

POST-WORK SIGNATURE

Total

$27,880.00

$ 1,20 0.00

l29,O8O.OO

l29,O8O.OO

Invoice Total:

Deposits (-):
Payments (-):

Total Due:

$29,OaO.OO

$o.oo

$ 18.122.0O

$ 1O,95a.OO

:

1

Signed Byl Signed By:



Fogle's Septic Clean, Inc.

Sykesville, MD 21784

lnvoice Date
6lt 412022

lnvoice #
333172 INVOICE

PLEASE PAY
THIS AMOWT $e',585 00

Make cher.*s paluble to: Fogle's Septic Clean. lnc.

Bill To:

CHIGUANG FENG
3605 HOLLAND HERBERT CT
ELLICOTT CITY, MD 21042

Phone # 410-795-5670

8]}50 (;ROVF, ANGI I,] RD
F]_l.tco]-f c|rY- Mr) 2t041

Fogle's Septic Clean, lnc.
580 Obrecht Road
Slkesvillc, MI) 21784

Due Date Rep Ship Date

6 412022 RI-C

Description Qtv Rate Amount

Permit #P22000715
Pump. crush and backfill existinS seplic tank and dry\\ell
Install 140'se$er line to county connection
tlaul in 2loads oldirl
Submit septic abandonment letter to Lloward County

MISS UTILITY #22I27457

\uL ltzttt

I4.585.00 1.1.5 85.00

PI-EAslr I)IIIACH ANI) ItI'IliRN TOP POR IION WITH PAYMI:N l'

Thank you lor your business.
Total $ 14.585.00

1.57o interest will be charged monthly on all unpaid balanccs after 30 days. $30 CHARGE
TOR RETURNED CHECK. RECEIP'I' DATE STAMPS ARE STRICTLY ENFORCED
for ALL DISCOTJNTS.

Billing Questions - call 410-795-5670

Payments/Cred its -$5,000.00

Customer Total Balance $e.8el.8l

I I

l
I P,O, NO,

6^0/2022 i

I

I

I

I

I

I


